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Goss Lake Eagle in Peril – Residents Urged to End Use of Personal Fireworks 

Fourth of July Personal Fireworks May Force Premature Fledging and Harm Our 
National Symbol 

LANGLEY Washington, Island County, June 17, 2024 -- Whidbey Island is home to the 
symbol of American greatness and patriotism: the Bald Eagle. An eagle’s nest on Goss 
Lake holds a baby that will be approximately 10 weeks old during Fourth of July 
celebrations, before the time when the average eaglet can safely fledge or learn to 
fly. Historically, Goss Lake is the scene of personal fireworks explosions before, during, 
and after the holiday, even though this activity, so close to the nest, is illegal and can 
cause injury or death to these majestic birds.  
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The Island County Sheriff has repeatedly stated in discussions with the Board of Island 
County Commissioners and Safe and Humane Fireworks that he lacks the staffing to 
enforce existing laws that forbid fireworks on private property. Despite the danger and 
illegality, residents and visitors around Goss Lake explode fireworks well inside the 
limits of protected space for the eagle’s nest during the Fourth of July holiday, year after 
year. Until more officers are on duty, it is up to citizens to protect eagles and their 
habitat. 

According to the Audubon Society, ten to twelve weeks of age is critical to fledging 
because that is when eaglets are physically ready to fly -- and why July 4th is such a 
dangerous time. Eagle parents abandon nests due to the noise, visual disturbance and 
smells generated by fireworks. “The timing of actual fledging can be influenced by 
human activity or disturbance around the nest, causing a premature fledge,” states the 
Audubon Society website. “Premature fledging can result in injury or even death of the 
eaglet. The parents can raise premature fledglings that fall to the ground for a short 
period, although predators and humans pose threats to survival. This developmental 
stage of newly flighted eaglets can be a most perilous time.” 

For more information on the damage that fireworks can do to our wildlife, you can 
contact Kurt License, the District Wildlife Biologist for Island County, at 
Kurt.Licence@dfw.wa.gov 

This Fourth of July, Safe and Humane Fireworks of Island County alerts all residents 
and visitors to stop using personal fireworks. Visit community fireworks instead to keep 
the magnificent bald eagles and the habitat we share safe. Scheduled professional 
fireworks displays will be held in Freeland, Langley and Oak Harbor in 2024. 

Safe and Humane Fireworks is an alliance of Island County citizens and organizations 
that supports permitted municipal fireworks displays on the Fourth of July and other 
holidays to prevent harm to people, pets, wildlife and the environment and preserve our 
quality of life. For more information, visit Safe and Humane Fireworks of Island County. 
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